
Printed at the GOVERNMENT PRESS, CEYLON. To be
purchased at the GOVERNMENTPUSLICA'rIONSBUREAU,COLOMBO
Annual Subscription (including Bills) Rs. 25, payable in
advance to the SUPERIN'rENDEN'r,GOVERNMENTPUBLICATIONS
BUREAU, POST OFFICE Box 500, Secretariat, Colombo 1

Price: 55cents Postage: 20cents

Printed on the Orders of Govern'ment

Date of Assent: February 16, 1956

Ceylon Parliamentary' Elections
(Amendment) Act,
No. 16 of 1956

PARLIAMENT OF CEY~p~
. II ~ I',~.I: .if. .•• ~;#'JI','\.~!.,.~.. - .........•',su "\.,

~ ~ ... ," '. '.~. '.:
4th Session 1955-56'':; ':' '...~~~.

,:/ ..::' ;,~'. ....•-.l , ".. r (. .....\.
~~~. (l~r,l,~'SjO ".;~
"~, l·· \'~ ." t\ fl , .._ .
~ ('to' ~ J\.~\ , I
\~ ~ ././._--~~r,,·~..,

)I_O~~:'~
.r ...... ,...



Amendmen. of
section 10
of the Cey10D
(Par Iiamentsl}
Electrons}
Order in
Council, 1946.

Shon title.

I ,

BE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent
Majesty, by and with the advice and consent of the
Senate and the House of Representatives of Ceylon
in this present Parliament assembled, and by the
authority of the same, as follows;-
1. This Act may be cited as the Ceylon Parliamen

tary Elections (Amendment) Act, No. 16 of 1956.
_, 2. Section 10 of the Ceylon (Parliamentary
Elections) Order in Council, 1946, hereinafter referred
to as "the Order in Council", is hereby amended as
follows:- ,

(1) in sub-section (2) of that section, by the sub
stitution, for the words" two thousand",
of the words" one thousand five hundred";

(2) in sub-section (3) of that section, by the sub
stitution, for the expression" at the next
revision of the register of electors for that
electoral district and not earlier.", of the
expression " on the date of publication of
the notice under section 22 (1) relating to
the next certification of the register of
electors for such electoral district, but the
revision of such register before such certi
fication shall be made on the basis of such
alteration."; and

(3) by the insertion, immediately after sub-section
(3) of that section, of the following sub
section :-
, "(3A) A notice published in the
Government Gazette under sub-section

, '"., (1) or sub-section (3) may' from time to
2-:1. N.R 5116-14.060 (1/56)

L. D.-D. 1/56.

AN' ACT TO AMEND THE CEYLON (PARLIAMENTARY
ELECTIONS) ORDER IN COUNCIL, 1946, TO GIVE
EFFECT TO SOME OF THE RECOMMENDATIONS OF THE
SELECT COMMITTEE APPOINTED BY THE HOUSE OF
REPRESENTATIVES TO REPORT ON AMENDMENTS TO
THAT ORDER IN COUNCIL SUBJECT TO SUCH MODI
FICATIONS AS ARE CONSIDERED NECESSARY, A.1'.lD TO
TERMINATE THE INCAPACITY TO WHICH ANY PERSON
IS SUBJECT ON THE DATE OF COMMENCEMENT OF
THIS ACT BY REASON OF A.!.~ ACT OR OMISSION
WHICH BEFORE THAT DATE 'VAS A CORRUPT PRACTICE
AND WHICH ON OR AFTER THAT DATE WILL BE AN
ILLEGAL PRACTICE.

[Date of Assent: February 16, 1956J

Ceylon Parliamentaru Elections '(Amendment) r 3 '
Act, No. 16 of 1956



3. Section 15 of the Order in Council is hereby
.amended ,as follows:-

(1) in sub-section (2) of that section, by the sub
stitution, for the words "the modification
. that", of the following:-

'C the modifications that sub-section
; r (2) of section 11 shall be read and con-

strued as if, for the words "or at such
'. other place", there were substituted the

~ words "and at such other places'), and
that section 12 shall be read and con
strued as if" for the words "two weeks') ,
there were substituted the words "four
weeks", and that'; and

'- (2) by the 'addition, at the end of that section, of '
the following sub-sections:-

, '(3) Where the name of any person
who is qualified in accordance with this

, , Order to have his name entered in any
. register of electors prepared under sub
section (1) for any electoral district has
'been 'omitted from that register, any
other' person may make an application to
,the registering officer of that electoral
district to have the .name of the first
mentioned person inserted in such
register. Such application shall be in
writing and shall be substantially in the
Form CC in the First Schedule to this
, Order and shall be made to such regis-
" tering officer so as to reach him wi thin :
four .weeks from the date of the publica
tion in the Government Gazette of the
notice of, completion of such register.
Where ~~application is made under this
sub-section, the registering officer shall, '

. '~s S?ori as. 'practicable, hold a public
inquiry into the- application, giving not

, . '

..

"4 ',Ceylon Parliamentary Elections (A mendment)
Act, No. 16 oj 1956

time be amended, in the' particulars in
paragraph (d) (iii) of sub-section (1)
required to be specified in that notice,
after notifying the proposed amendments
,to the public in such manner as the Com
missioner may determine and after
giving an opportunity to the public for'
making representations in regard to the
proposed amendments." .

Amendment of
section 16
of the Order
in Council.



Amendment of
section 16
of the Oreler
in Council.

I ,

. 4. Section 16 of the Order in Council, as amended
by Act No. 48 of 1949, is hereby amended, in sub
section (1) of that section, by the substitution, for
all the words from " the Commissioner " to the end
of that sub-section, of the following:-

" the Commissioner shall cause the revision
of such register to be commenced and a notifica
tion,' stating that the revision of such register

'.has commenced and informing every person
.qualified to be an elector for such electoral dis
trict how he may ascertain whether his name
.'is in such register and, if not, how he may
secure its insertion therein, to be published in
the Government Gazette in Sinhalese, Tamil

. and English and in at least one Sinhalese news-
paper, one Tamil newspaper and one English
newspaper circulating in such electoral district
. and to be conspicuously displayed at public
...places within such electoral district."

':Ceylo'nParliamentary Elections (Amendment) 5
Act, No. 10 oj 1956

less than twelve days' written notice. of
the inquiry and of the date on which
and the time and place at which the
inquiry will commence to the apphcant
and to the person in respect of whom
the application is made, and, if such
person appears at the inquiry and sup
ports the. application and satisfies
the registering officer that the a'.Pph~a
tion should be allowed, the application
shall be allowed and, if such person
fails to do so, the application shall be
disallowed.
(4) Before the certification of the

register of electors prepared for any elec
toral district under sub-section (1), app
lication may be made to the registering
officer of that electoral district for the
correction of an existing entry relating
to the applicant in such register, and,
where such application is made, the
registering officer shall, if he is satisfied.
after such inquiry as' he deems fit that
the entry relates to the applicant and is
erroneous or defective in any particular,
cause the necessary amendment in the
entry t~ be made.,".

... , .



.. 6.' Section 19 of the Order in Council is hereby
amended as follows:- ...
, (1) ~ sub-section (3) of that section, by the

, . . substitution, for the words " as though
the references therein", of the follow-
Ing:-

" as though the references in section 12
to two weeks were references to' four
weeks and as though the references
therein "; and .

(2) by the addition, at the end of that section,
of the following sub-section:-

" (4) Where a person is entitled tc
claim under sub-section (1) to have his
name inserted or retained in any regis":
ter of electors" any ,other person may
make an application to the registering
officer to have the name of the first
mentioned person inserted or reta ined"
in that register. Such a.pplication shall:
be in writing and shall be substantially
in the Form CC in the First Schedule

. to this Order and shall be made to the
registering officer so as to. reach him
within four weeks from the date of the
publication in the Government Gazette
of ,the notice of the completion of
Lists A .and B. Where an application
is made under this sub-section, the
registering officer shall, as soon as
practicable, .hold a public inquiry into
the application, giving not less than

,twelve days": written notice of the
inquiry and of the date on which and
the time and place at which the inquiry
will commence to the applicant and to .
the person in respect of whom the
application is made, and, if such person
appears at the inquiry and supports -,

:, the application and satisfies the regis
,tering officer that· the application
.;'should be allowed, the application shall

'6 .Ceylon' 'Parliamentary Elections (Amen'ii~e;"'t)
Act, No. 16 oJ 1956

.: 5. : Section 18 of the Order in Council is hereby
amended, in sub-section (2) of that section, by the
substitution, for the words" or at such other place" ,
of _th~words " and at such other places ".

Amendment of,
section . l~. . .;'
of the Order
in Council.

Amendmen\ or
section 18
of the Order
in Council.



, ' 8.' (1) The following new sections are hereby
inserted immediately after section 22, and shall have
effect as section 22A and section 22B respectively, of
the Order in Council:- '
"hLan~age of' 22A. (1) In this section-
t e registers

". -of electors ". language of the maj ori ty ", with
and the list.
prepared for reference to any electoral
the purpose of district, means the language
revising such h
regis~I'II.' , ,(other t an the, English

,' language) spoken by the
r " majority of the people of that
~ electoral district,

" language of the minority ", with
reference to any electoral
district, means the language
(other than the language of
the majority -and the '-Eng
lish language) spoken by not
less than twenty per centum
of the people of that electoral
district, and -

"prescribed' date'" means such
date as shall be specified, for
the purposes of this section,
by the Minister by Order
published in the Gazette.

(2) After the prescribed date, the
register of electors for each electoral
district and' the lists prepared for the

Insertion
of new
sections 22"
and 220 in
the Order in
Council,

, :' r

Amendment of
section 20
of the' Order" "
in Council. .~

'.. .••. I; I.

,,
':

.: c" .....

7. Section 20 of the Order in Council is hereby
amended by the addition, at the end of that section,
of !the following sub-section :- , " ,

" (3) Application may be made to the regis
tering officer of any electoral district before the
certification of the register of electors for that
district for the correction of an existing entry
relating to the applicant in that register, and,

- where such application is made, the registering
., officer shall, if he is satisfied after such inquiry

as he deems fit that the entry relates to the
applica.nt and is erroneous or defective in any
particular, cause the necessary amendment in
the entry to be made. "~ - - "

Ceylon, P(1-rtiamentury Elections (A mendment) 7-
-' , ' "I Act , No. 16 'of 1956

be allowed, and, if such person fails to
do so, the application, shall be dis
allowed. ".



'.'9. Section 30 or.' the Order in Council is hereby
amended, in' sub-section (2) 'of that section, by the
omission of the word." true ". . .

'. I
\ .. :.

'.

Re-insertion
of name
deleted from
register of
electors,

purpose of revising such register shall
be in the language of the majority and
in the English language and, where
there is a language of the minority, in
such language of the minority .
22B. Where any person whose name

is deleted from any register of electors .
as he is subject under this Order to the
incapacity of being registered as an
elector by reason of-

(a) his conviction of a corrupt or
an illegal practice, or

(b) the report of an election judge
or of the Supreme Court
published under sub-section
(2) of section 82D, or

(c) his conviction of an offence
under section 52 or section
53, or

(d) the operation of section 4A,
ceases to be subject to that incapacity,
then, if he makes a written application.
to the registering officer of any electoral
district to have his name entered in the
register of electors 'for that electoral ...,
district and such registering officer is
satisfied that such person is' not dis-'
qualified under section 4 to have his name ..
entered in such register, the name
of such person shall be inserted in such
register. The insertion of such name in
such register shall have effect notwith
standing that at the time of such inser
tion the revision or certification of such
register under this Order may have been
completed. ".

(2) Where any person was on the day immediately
preceding the date of commencement of this Act
subject to the incapacity referred to in section 22B
inserted in the Order in Council by sub-section (1)
of this section, the provisions of the said section 22B .
shall apply to that person in like manner as they "f

apply to any person subject to such incapacity on or
after such date.

8 Ceylon Parlioanentaa-u Elections (A mendment)
Act, No. 16 of 1956

Amendmen' of
section SO
of the Order
in Council.

. .

l _••



Amendmens of
section 35
of the Order
in Council.

... .

(2) by the insertion, immediately after sub-section
(1) of that section, of the following new sub
sections :-

" (lA) (a) Where a general election
is to be held, the secretary of any
political party may, not later than ten
days after the date of publication of
the Proclamation dissolving Parlia
ment, make on behalf of such party a
wri tten application to the Commis
sioner for the determination of one
approved symbol to be allotted to the
candidates of .such party, and, if two
or more candidates of such party are
candidates for the election in an elec
toral district for which two or more·
members are to be returned, such ap
plication shall specify which one of
those candidates should be allotted the
approved symbol determined by the
Commissioner . Upon such applica
tion being made, the Commissioner
shall determine an approved symbol
for allotment to candidates of such
party.

(b) Where' the election in any elec
toral district is adjourned under sub-

. , . ' ...' section (1) to enable a poll to be taken
and there is an approved symbol deter
mined by the Commissioner under

.". '." " " paragraph (a) of. this sub-section in
, t.: : , ',';, : ;, . J ,,respect of. any poli tical party which
",".:' " ..,' has any candidate or .candidates for

. ,.,., ',election in that electoral district, then,
" ':. in lieu o.f the allotmentof an approved

';', : ", '_. '.t" s:ymbolIn: accor~ance with the provi
:'.,~......,: .: '~.: .sions of. sub-section :(1);, there shall,-

Ceylon Parliamenta1'Y Elections (A mendment) 9.
Act, No. 16 of 1956

fO. Section 35 of the Order in Council is hereby
amended as follows:-
, (1) in sub-section (1) of that section-

(a) by the substitution, for the express~on
"shall allot ", of the expressIon
"shall, subject to the provisions of
sub-section (IA), allot", and

(b) by the substitution, for the words " In
this sub-section ", of the words C C In
this section ":



•• .1.",

. (i) if only one member is to be
returned' for that electoral
district, be allotted the
approved symbol so deter
mined to the candidate of
that party for election in
that electoral district, and

(ii)' if two or more members are to
be returned for that electoral
district, be allotted the
approved symbol so deter
mined,. where there is' only
one candidate of that party
for election in that electoral
district, to that candidate,
and, where there are two or
more candidates of that party
for election in that electoral
district, to that one of those
candidates who is specified
in respect of that electoral
district in the application
made on behalf of that party
under paragraph (a) of this
sub-section:

Provided that, where one of two or
more candidates of a political party
for election in an electoral district for
which two or more members are to be
returned is allotted an' approved
symbol determined by the Commis
sioner under paragraph (a) of this sub
section in respect of that party ~ the
other candidate or each of the other
candidates of that party for election
in that electoral district shall be allot
ted an approved symbol in accordance
with the provisions of sub-section (1).

(c) An approved symbol allotted
. , ' .under this sub-section to a candidate
. ).' ~'.:: shall be printed on the ballot paper

:, .~ .... -: ::." opposite that candidate's name.
,'J' _, . =, (d) An approved symbol determined

• , r •• ~ '. .: by the Commissioner under para-
_.::.:': ..... .. graph (a) of this sub-section for allot
. '. _,"':'·f:. ':' i::. ment.to the candidates of any politi-

. '_ ; ; .: ~•• .• ; I.~ I cal' party shall not ·be allotted under
.' '-.,.' .'. sub-section (1) to any other candidate.

"10 Ceylon Parliamentaru Elections (4.mendme.nt)
. Act, No .: 16,of 1956



," ; I:

] . ' .

i '."', '

. '._'.

(IB) Where a candidate is nomi
nated by means of two or more nomi
nation papers, he shall, forthwith
after an approved symbol is allotted
to him under sub-section (1) or sub
section (La), select one of those nomi
nation papers and notify the return
ing officer in writing that the name
of the proposer and the name of the
seconder appearing in the selected
nomination paper should be specified
as the name of his proposer and the
Harne of his seconder in the notice
relating to the election to be publish
ed under sub-section (3), and, if such
candidate does not so select and, so
notify, the returning officershall select
one of such nomination papers for the
purpose of determining the name of
the proposer and the name of the
seconder of such candidate to be speci
fied in such notice,";

(3) in sub-section (2) of that section by the substi
tution, for the expression " allotted to each

, candidate, and", of the expression "allotted
, to each candidate, a statement of the nomi
nation paper selected under sub-section (In)
by or in respect of each candidate nominated
by means of two or more nomination papers,
and" ,,

(4) in sub-section (3) of that section by the substi
tition, in paragraph (c) of that sub-section,
for the words " and the names of their pro
,posers and seconders; ", .of the following:-

, ," and the name of the proposer and
the name of the seconder appearing
in the nomination paper of each
candidate who is nominated by means
of one nomination paperonly, and the
name of the proposer and the name of
the seconder appearing in the nomi
nation ,paper selected under sub
section (Ln) by or in respect of each
candidate who is nominated by means

T" • ':'" '" i, '!' l,.of. two o~more nomination papers; ";
<";~I ;" -.' .,,', and" , ' .'~, . . . .... .

eeylon Parliamenucru Elections (A mendment) 11
Act, No,' 16 of 1956



. 12. 'Section ,47 of .the 'Order in Council is hereby
amended by the addition, 'at the end of that section, of
the following sub-section :.-... , . . ..';: '''.)
;" ;"~'(4). '1'he 'presid.in~"()fficer'shah despatch to the
returning officer, together with the'.packets and the

'11. Section 39 of the Order in Council is hereby '"
amended by the repeal of sub-section (5) of that section
and the substitution therefor of the following sub
section :-

" (5) (a) Not more than two polling, agents of
each candidate shall at any time be admitted to

.. or be allowed' to remain in any polling station
.. which is not reserved exclusively for the use of

female voters.
: . (b ) Not more than one polling agent of each
_ ..'candidate shall at any time be admitted to or be
. .allowed to remain in any polling station reserved
:' exclusively for the use of female voters .
. ' . (c) rhe Commissioner may, by notice published
;.. in the Government Gazette, order that, in the case
~:',~of any polling station reserved exelusively for the
.~'. use of female voters, DO male pollin9 agent shall
-::.'be admitted to that polling station.'

- .. ., ~ '.. ';' , ,
J... - .. ~.~ • j .-

12 Ceylo.n' 'Parli"amentfL'ry Elections, (A mendment)
Act, No. 16 of 1956

. (5) 'by' the insertion, immediately after sub-section
(3) of that section, of the following sub
sections: -. .

" (3A) Where due to any emergency
it is necessary that the situation of any
polling station should be different from
that specified in a notice published
under sub-section (3), the Commis
sioner may cause the situation of that
polling station to be altered after
consulting the candidates.

(3B) Where due to any emergency
the poll for an election in any electo
ral district cannot be taken on the date
specified in the notice relating to the
election published under sub-section
(3), the Commissioner may, by Order
published in the Gooernment Gazette,
appoint another date for the taking
of such poll, and such other date shall
not be earlier than the twenty-first
day after the publication of the Order
in the Government Gazette.". .

Amendment of
Bedion 47
of the Order
in Oolmtil.

Amenchnent of
section 3V
of the Order
in Coa.AoiJ.



Amendment of
section 52
Qf the Order
in Council.

Amendment of
section 48
of the Order
in Council.

· t~. Section 52 of the Order in Council is hereby
amended by the insertion, inunediately after sub
section. (1) of that section, of the following sub
sections: - ,. .

" (1A) No person shall, on a.ny date on which a
·.poll. is taken at a polling station, do any of the.
following acts within a distance of fifty yards of

· the entrance of that polling station: - . . .'
.J (a) canvassing for votes;

~'I;....(b) soliciting the vote of any elector;
~.~:~(0)' 'p~rsuading any elector not· to vote for any.

particular candidate ; - '. '. _:.' .1 •• ' '.!

.~':"::.-(d),.,p~rsuading any elector not to vote at the
,....,. . election· . . I
~ , ; ~,...";..~'.:':....! .

· 1'3. Section 48 of the Order in Council is hereby
amended as follows:-

(1) in sub-section (1) of that section-
(a) by the substitution, for all the words

from "may a.ppoint " to " attend",.
of the following:-
'may appoint not more than two
agents, hereinafter referred to as
the" counting agents", to attend' ;
and

(b) by the substitution, for the words
. " name and address of the counting
agent ", of the words " name and
address or names and addresses of
the counting agent or agents"; and

(2) .in 'sub-section (2) of that section, by the sub-.
) . stitution, for the words" a counting agent,

to such counting agent,", of the words
" any counting agent or agents, to such or
each such counting agent,".

Ceylon Pariiamenuiru Elections (A mendment) 13
Act, No. 16 of 1956

·.ballot box or boxes, a statement specifying' the num-
· her of ballot papers entrusted to such presiding offi-
· cer and accounting for them under the heads of-
: (a) ballot papers issued to voters, other than spoilt

ballot papers,
. (b) spoilt ballot papers, and
. (0) unused ballot papers.".



15. Section 58 of the Order in Council is hereby
amended, in sub-section (1) of that section as amended
by Act No. 26 of 1953, as follows:-
.. (1) by the' omission of paragraph (c) of that

sub-section; .

(IB) No person shall, on any date on which a poll
is taken at any polling station,-

(a) use or operate, within or at the entrance of
.. a polling station or in any public or private
place in the neighbourhood thereof, any
megaphone or loudspeaker or other appara
tus for magnifying or reproducing the

. human voice, or .
(b) shout or otherwise act in a disorderly manner

. .: within or at the entrance of. a polling
. ::. . station or in any public or private place in

. '. . the neighbourhood thereof,
so as to cause annoyance to any person visiting the
polling station for the .poll or so as to interfere with
the work of the officersand other persons 'on duty at the
polling station. Every person who contravenes the ,
provisions of this sub-section shall be guilty of an
offence and shall, on conviction after summary trial
before a Magistrate, be liable to a fine not exceeding
one hundred rupees or to imprisonment of either des
cri ption for a term not exceeding one month or to both
such fine and imprisonment. ... ;'

-, : ..
(1C) Any police officermay take such steps, and use

such force, as may be reasonably necessary for pre
venting any contravention of the provisions of sub
section (1B), and may seize any apparatus used for .
such contravention.' . ' .

.' ,

Amendment of
section 6B
of the Order
in Council.

..

.14 GeyltJn·~Pa1·liamenta.1'Y'Elections (Amendment)
Act, No. 16 of 1956

(e) distributing or exhibiting any handbill,
placard, poster or notice relating to the
election (other than any official handbill,
placard, poster or notice) or any symbol
allotted under section 35 to any candidate.

Every person who contravenes the provisions of this ....
sub-section shall be guilty of an offence and shall, on
conviction after summary trial before a Magistrate, be
liable to a fine not exceeding one hundred ru pees or to
imprisonment of either description for a term not ex-

.., " '" ceeding one month or to both such fine and imprison
ment.



Termination or
incapacity
arising ~ut of
commrasron,
prior to com
mencement of
thi. Act, of
• corrupt
practice
under section
68 (1) (c) or (f)
of the Order
in Council.

t, ,...-, ......

I '.

I '," Where' .such election agent,' after
. informing such presiding officer of the
.name 'of any polling agent appointed to
act at such station, revokes the appoint
ment of that polling agent and appoints
another polling agent to such station,

, such election agent shall inform such
presiding officer in writing of the
revocation of such appointment and of
the ~ame of the new "polling agent
appointed to such station. ".

~....

.' 17. Section 61 of the Order in Council is hereby
. amended-. in sub-section· (1) of that section, as
follows:- .
, .
.' . (1) by the substitution, for 'the words "before
: :.' , the opening of the poll ", of the words
.',. " before the opening of, or during, the
. , poll"; and
. (2) by the addition, at the end of' that sub-

, , ' section, of the following:-

' ...

':"i6~' Where a person is' at the commencement of
this Act subject to the incapacity of being registered
as an elector or of voting at any election under the
Order in Councilor of being elected or appointed as
~ Senator or Member of Parliament by reason of his
conviction of a corrupt practice under paragraph (c)
or paragraph (f) of sub-section (1) of section 58 of
the .Order in Council prior to its amendment by
section 15 of this Act or of the finding in the report
of an election' judge or of the Supreme Court pub
lished under sub-section (2) of section 82D of the
Order in' Council that he has committed a corrupt
practice under either or both of those paragraphs,
such incapacity shall cease on the date of the com-

~: mencement of this Act notwithstanding anything to
the contrary in the Order in Council.

:',,:::. (~) in paragraph (e) of that sub-section, by the
substitution, for the words "such
election; or" , of the words "such
election, ";

.. "(3) by the omission of paragraph (f) of that sub-
:;\:: ,: .l· i " section; and . OJ , :

(4) by the' omission of all the' words from
, "Provided, however, that" to the end of

that sub-section.

'Ceyl()'n'" Parliamentaru Elections (A mendmerit) 15
Act, No. 16 of 1956



20. .Bection 73A inserted in, the Order in Council
'by Act 'No. 26 of 195? is hereby repealed. " " I

, 21. The following new sections are hereby
inserted immediately after section 92, and shall have
'effect as section 92A and section 92B respectively, of
the Order in Council: - ,
," Requisition. 92A. (1) Where the Commissionering of, '
premises fOl" considers that any premises, other than
~::ti~~s~olling any school referred to in section 92, are

required for the purpose of being used
as a polling station, he may requisition
those ~remis~s. for that purpose by
order .m writing addressed to and
served on the person in actual posses-

, ,SIon of _those premises' or, where DO. . ,
person IS In such actual possession, on
.the owner of such premises.

expenses.

False
declaration
8S to election

19. The following new sections are hereby
inserted immediately after section 68, and shall have
effect as section 68A and section 68B respectively, of
the Order in Council:-
"Printing, 68A. A candidate, or an election
etc. of •
election agent, who prints, publishes, distri-
publications butes or posts up or causes to be printed,
by candidates d
and election published, distributed or poste up
"agents. any -advertisement, handbill, placard

or poster which refers to any election
and which does not bear upon its face
the names and addresses of its printer
and publisher shall be guilty of an
illegal practice. ,-' - ,
68B. A candidate, or an election ~

agent, who knowingly makes the
declaration as to election expenses
required by section 70 falsely shall. be
.guilty of, an illegal practice.," .

18. Section 68 of the Order in Council is hereby
amended, in sub-section (1) of that section, by the
substitution, for paragraph (b) of that sub-section,
of the following paragraph:-

" (b) a reasonable numher of polling agents for
each polling district having regard to the
need to revoke the appointment of any
polling agent for that polling district
during the poll ; "'.

'16 Ceylon~Parliamentary Elections (Amendment)
Act, No. 16 of 1956

Repeal 01
section 7SA
of the Order
in Council,
Tneertion of
new sections
~A and 928
in the Order
\n Council.

1 '
.' -'_, ;,,: !'

i; '. ,I. '·::.i

Insertion of, '
new eections
68A and
S8D in the "
Order in "
Council.

, '-

Amendment of
section 68
of the Order in
Council.



;.. ; .,'

.'..
J' .

Compensation
for requi
sitioning
premises.

• -, ••• I (2) Where any premises are requisi
tioned under sub-section (1), the period
of such requisition shall not extend
beyond four weeks.

(3) In this section, "premises"
. means any land, building or part of a
. building and includes a hut, shed
or structure or any part thereof.
92B. (1) ,\Vhere any premises are

requisitioned under section 92A, the
Commissioner shall pay, out of moneys
provided for the purpose by Parlia-
ment, compensation for such requisition
to the person who was in actual posses
sion of those premises immediately
before· the· requisition or, where no

. person was -in such actual possession,
the owner. of those premises, and 'shall
make good any damage ..done to those
premises during the period of the
requisition.

. .
(2) The amount of compensation

payable under sub-section (1) in respect
of any premises shall ·be·determined by

. taking into consideration- .' ..
(a) the rent payable in respect of

those premises, or; where 'no
rent is so payable, the rent
payable for similar premises
in the locality, and ,

(b) if, in consequence of the requi-
sition of those premises, the
nerson who was in actual
possession of those premises
immediately before' the re
quisition was compelled to
change his residence or place
of business,' the reasonable

.. . . expenses, if any;' incidental
,'. ......to. such change.

(3). Where any person entitled to
compensation under this section is
aggrieved by the decision of the Com
missioner in regard to the amount of
the compensation, that person may
appeal In wrrting to the Minister from
that decision .. 1!Pc)~ such appeal being
made, the Minister shall. appoint an

.'Ceylon Parliamentary Elections (Amendment) 17
.Act, No. 16 of .1956



(Address of witness)

(Signature of witness)

(Signature or thumb mark of appllcanb)

Signed or marked by the above-named applicant in my presence
this day of 19 at .

.....................•.••••.•.••••••.••••....

2. l\Iy address for notice is _ .
Dated the day of 1\:J .

.......... .. .. . ........... ...... ........................

...... .............................................................................." ..

........................................................................................

FORM CC
(SECTION 15 AND SECTION' 19)

Form of application by a person to have the name of another
person, inserted or retained in a register of electors.

To the. Registering Officer of Electoral District.

I, (give name, christian or ae or other names in full:
surname or ge name first) hereby
declare that (give name, christian or
ge or other names in full of the person in respect of whom the
application is made; surname or ge name first) .
possesses the residential qualification at (state
exact address or addresses of residence in the electoral district
and all the following particulars which are applicable) .
in the (Tulans or Wasama or Vldana's
division) in the division of the (Korale .,...
or Udayar or Vidane Arachchi) of in the
Divisional Revenue Officer's division of : or in
the Ward in the town of .
in the above-named electoral district and that his name has been
omitted/expunged from the register of electors/omitted from List
B Jincluded in List A for the above-named electoral district, and
I hereby apply to have such name inserted /retained in the afore
said register on the following grounds (state grounds of appli
cation) :-

Amenmnent of
the Firat
Schedule to the
Order in
Council.

18 Ceylon Parliameniaru Elections (Amendment)
Act, No. 16 of 1956

arbitrator and shall refer such appeal
to him for determination, and the deter
.mination of the arbitrator on such
appeal shall be final. ".

22. The First Schedule to the Order in Council is
hereby amended by the insertion, immediately after
Form C, of the following Form:-

-It


