
•

Printed at the GOVERNMENT PRESS, CEYLON. To be
purchased at the GOVERNMENTPUBLICATIONSBUREAU, COLOMBO
Annual Subscription (including Bills) Rs. 25, payable in
advance to the SUPERINTENDENT,GOVERNMENT PUBLICATIONS
BUREAU, POST OFFICE Box 500, Secretariat, Colombo 1

Price: 25 cents. Postage: 10 cents,

Printed on the Orders of Government

Date of Assent : May 2, 1957

-.

'"
. ,.

Workmen's Compensation [Amendment]

Act, No. 31 of 1957

, .. ,
-,.: ,.{_.. :'",..y

..~...t .- ..._.,....-:.,.""."

.... '. ' '\ \951
l· \\.)-\

- ".J '

'.'

Ist Session 1956-57

PARLIAMENT OF CEYLON



Amendment of
section 4 of
the principal
enactment.

Amendment of
section 2 of
Chapter 117.

Short title.

Chapter 117.
Vol. nr.,
page 892:.

3

[Date of Assent: May 2, 1957J

BE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent
:~1ajesty, by and with the advice and consent of the
Senate and the House of Representatives of Ceylon
.in this present Parliament assembled, and by the
authority of the same, as follows :-

1. This Act may be cited as the Workmen's Com
:pensation (Amendment) Act, No. 31 of 1957,

2. Section 2 (1) of the Workmen's Compensation
'Ordinance (hereinafter referred to as the ., principal
'enactment") is hereby amended, in the definition" of
" workman", as follows:-
(1) by the substitution, for the words "three

hundred rupees" , of the words "four
hundred rupees";

(2) by the substitution, in paragraph (b) of that
. definition, for the words "or of any Defence

Force Corps constituted under the Defence
Force Ordinance", of the words "other
than a person employed in a civilian capacity
in any of those forces".

3. Section 4 of the principal enactment is hereby
amended by the repeal of sub-section (1) thereof and
by the substitution, for that sub-section, of the
following sub-section:-

"(1) If a workman-
(a) contracts an occupational disease described in

the first column of Part A of Schedule III
whilst he is employed in any process described
in the corresponding entry in the second
column of that Part, or

(b) contracts an occupational disease described in the
first column of Part B of the aforesaid
Schedule whilst he is in the service of an
employer ..in whose service he has been
employed for a continuous period of not less
than six months in any process described in
the corresponding entry in the second column
of that Part,

1-1, N.R9653-3,375 (2/57)

fV01'kmen's Compensation (Amendment)
Act, No. 31 oj 1957

L. D.-O.7J52 .

.AN ACT TO AMEND THE WORKMEN'S COMPENSATION
ORDINA.1~CE.



4 Workmen's Compensation (A mendment)
Act, No. 31 of 1957

the contracting of the disease shall be deemed t
be an injury by accident within the meanmg c
section 3, and, unless the employer proves the COL,;
trary, the accident shall be deemed to have arif{
out of and in the course of the employment.". ~

4. Section 11 of the principal enactment is hereb,
amended, in sub-section (1) t,hereof,-

(a) by' the substitution, for the words "an:
dependant", of the words "one or more Q
the dependants", and

(b) by the substitution, for the words "tha>
dependant ", of the words " the dependau-
.or depend ants ". ;

5. Section 16 of the principal enactment is herebj •
amended, in sub-section (1) thereof, by the substitution •
for the words " six months " wherever those word: ~
occur in that sub-section, of the words" one year". -

6. Section 20 of the principal enactment is herebj ,
amended by the repeal of sub-section (2) of that sectior !

and by the substitution, for that sub-section, of the
following sub-section:-

" (2) Where an employer is served with a notice '
under sub-section (1), he shall, unless he disclaiIll!
liability to deposit compensation on any ground.
other than the ground that there are no dependant~
of. the deceased workman,. make the deposit within j

thirty days after the service of the notice.". :

7. Section 21 of the principal enactment is hereby ,
amended by the repeal of sub-section (6) thereof and
the substitution therefor" of the following:
sub-section: -

" (6) Where the employer of an injured workman
offers to him the services of a registered medical '
practitioner free of charge and- '
(a) the workman accepts such offer but deliberately

disregards the instructions of the registered
medical practitioner, or

'(b) the workman refuses to accept such offer and
thereafter either fails to take treatment
regularly from a registered medical practi
tioner or whilst being regularly attended by
a registered medical practitioner deliberately
disregards' the instructions of snell'
practitioner,

)

Amendment of
section 21 of
the principal
enactment .

Amendment of
section 20 of
the principal
enactment.

Amendment of
section IG of
the principal
enactment .

Amendment of
section 11 of
the principal
enactment.

I
t
t

" ,,

. I
j :

I'.. L

\ .,'l
t I'

.. t
.1 j,. r~ I
't

. h
•
I'\i

I.
;'
I~ I

.I
; I

1 ;
"

t. I
• ,

~

'.
ir

"

f '



Cap. 86.

Amendment of
section 41 of
the principal
enactment.

Amendment or
section 40 of
the principal
enactment.

9. Section 41 of the principal enactment is hereby
nnended as follows:-
(1) by the re-numbering of that section as sub

section (1) of section 41 ;
(2) by the addition, immediately after re

numbered sub-section (1), of the following
sub-section: - .

" (2) If any sum referred to in sub
section (1) cannot be recovered in the
manner specified in that sub-section within
six months from the date on which such
sum becomes due from the person liable to
pay it, the Commissioner may make appli
cation, where such sum exceeds three
hundred rupees, to the District Court or,
where such sum. does not exceed three
hundred rupees, to the Court of Requests,
within whose jurisdiction such person
resides, for the recovery of such sum by the
seizure and sale of the immovable property
of such person, and, upon such application
being made, the court shall issue to the
Fiscal a writ for the recovery of such sum
by the seizure and sale of such immovable
property. The provisions of the Civil
Procedure Code relating to the seizure and
sale of immovable property by the Fiscal

JV01'kmen's Compensation (Amendment) 5
Act, No. 31.0/1957

tthen , if the disregard referred to in paragraph (a)
lor the refusal and failure or disregard referred to
:in paragraph (b) is or are unreasonable in the cir
.~stances of the case and the injury is aggravated
~:-~reby, the injury and the resulting disablement
:shall be deemed to be of the same nature and dura
tion as they might reasonably be expected to be if
the workman had been regularly attended by a
registered medical practitioner and had not delibe
rately disregarded .the instructions of such practi
tioner; and compensation, .if any, shall be payable
accordingly. " .

8.' Section 40 of the principal enactment is hereby
rmended, by the substitution for the words "or to
.nforca any liability incurred under this Ordinance."
r the words " or, except as provided in section 41
~:), . to enforce any liability incurred under this
urdinance.' . . .'



1

12. Schedule II to the principal enactment, 8
amended by regulations made under that enactmer:
and published in the Gazette of April 28, 1944, an
In the Gazette of October 6, 1950, is hereby furthe
amended as follows:-
(1) in clause 3 of that Schedule by the substitutioc
. . for the expression "twenty-five" of th

expression " ten ";
(2) in clause 7 (a) of that Schedule by the omissio;

of all the words from" which" to " roof Jt

11. Section 48 of the principal enactmentis herel
amended by the addition, at the end of that sectio..
of the following sub-section: -
.. " (6) Every petition of appeal shall be accompanif

by a duplicate thereof, and the Registrar of tl.
Supreme Court shall transmit such duplicate t
the Commissioner. ".

10. Section 43 of the principal enactment is here ;
amended by the substitution, for the words" sh .
be liable to pay the full amount", of the words" sh .
be guilty of an offence and shall, on conviction aft'
sUlfimary trial by a Magistrate, be liable to pay a fi;
not exceeding one thousand rupees, and shall also t:
liable to pay the full amount "'. ~

r
'"

..
cc Recovery of amounts due. ".

in execution of a writ issued by a c.
and to the making and adjudicatior,
claims in respect of immovable prop:
seized by the Fiscal shall apply tel
seizure and sale of immovable prof,?
for the recovery of the sum specified in .
Commissioner's application and to ~
making and adjudication of claims in I
pect of immovable property seized for
recovery of such sum. For the purpoSt _
the application of such provisions the E.
so specified shall be deemed to be due 0:
decree entered by the court and the C::-
missioner shall be deemed to be the ju-
ment creditor and the person. liable to 1-
such sum shall be deemed to be t
judgment debtor. "; and

(3) by the substitution, for the marginal note to tl. -
section, of the following marginal note:-

Workmen's Compensation (A mendment)
Act, No. 31 oj 1957

6

Amendment of
Schedule II to
the principal
enactment.

Amendment of
section 48 of
the principal
enactment.

Amendment of
section 43 of
the principal
enactment.

.' ~

I, .

·.
• I,
I"•

, .

· ', I
I
i
I

I

'l :, ,
I

. I, .

,...
I

, I

• I

,I .
, I



Replacement of
Schedule ill co
the principal
f!Jlactment.

~ompr6ssedair Illness or its sequetee Any pecoesa carried on in compressed
~ nir ..

'oisoning by lead tetra-ethyl .. Any process involving the usc of lend
tetra-ethyl

·oisoning by n'itroua fumes .. Any process involving exposure to
nitrous fumes

mthrax .. Any employment--
(a) involving the handling of-

(i) 'Wool, hair, bristles or
animal oerccses or parts
of suoh cereuses, includ
ing hides, hoofs and
horns, or

(ii) articles manufuotured
therefrom : or

(b) in connection with nnimnls
infected with anthrax

Description of Occupational Dosoription of Process
Disease

SCHEDULE ill
(section 4)
Part A

(5)

c:I ...
......

(3)

lVo1'kmen's Compensation (Amendment) 'J.
Act, No. 31 oj 1957

in clause 29 of that Schedule by the omission
of the words "in any Government
Department ";

in clause 34 of that Schedule by the substitution,
for the word " thereof. '), of the
following :-
" thereof; or ";

by the addition, at the end of that Schedule, of
the following clauses:-
" 35. empl.oyed in any radio rediffusion

service: or
35. employed as a carter; or
37. employed in, or in connection with, the

catching of fish; or
38. employed, otherwise than in a clerical

capacity, on any premises wherein the
business of maintaining or repairing
any machinery or vehicles is carried
on; or

39. employed as a performer in any circus
or acrobatic show; or

40. employed in a meat stall; or
41. employed in the transport of fish; or
42. employed in a petrol depot.".

13. Schedule III to the principal enactment is
uereby repealed and the following new Schedule is
mbstituted therefor:-



(2) in column (2) of that Schedule, by the inserti.
of the amount" 4,500 " at the end of ili
column;

14. Schedule IV to the principal enactment
hereby amended as 'follows:-

(1) in column (1) of that Schedule-

(a) by the insertion of the amount " 300'
at the end of that part of that cohnr
which contains the words "Mo:
than-"; and

(b) by the insertion of the amount "300
at the end of that part of that colun
which contains the words "But DI
more than-";

Any prooess involving exposure te ' ~
action of radium, radio-active -
tances, or X'rays ,~

Any process involving the lJR~'
phosphorus or its prepuratiota ~=
compounds , :

Handling benzene or any of .t.ah_I,
logues and any procoss in the tn:1
facture or involving the use: I
benzene or any of its homologue-

Handling any nitro or amido deriva:
of benzene or any of its homolor:
or any process in the manufectur ,
involving the use thereof ' .

Any process involving tho product"
liberation 01' utilization of bal:::
derivatives of hydro-carbons of ',j
aliphatic series , ...

Any process involving the ha~d~ 0

use of tar, pitch, bitumen, miners!,;
paraffin, or the compounds, prod;"
or residues of theso substances '!

\.

1-

Part B

Lend poisoning or its sequelae
excluding poisoning by lead
tetra-ethyl

Mercury poisoning or its sequelae

Pathological manifestations due to
Ca) radium and other radio-active

substances ;
(b) X-rays

Phosphorus poisoning or itfl
aoquolae

Poisoning by benzene and its
homologues, or the sequelae of
such poisoning

Poisoning by nitro or amido
derivatives of benzene and its
homologues 01' tho sequelae of
such poisoning

Poisoning by the 'halogen deri
vatives of hydro-carbons of the
aliphatic series

Primary opitheliomntous cancer of
the skin

Chrome ulceration or its sequelae

Arsenical poisoning or its sequelae

\~
----------------------------------------~l -Description of Occupational i

Disease Description of Process

Any process involving the prott
liberation or utilisation of arsa,
its compounds i

Any process involving the use of chr.=
acid or bichromate of ammcc.>
potassium or sodium or i.,-
preparations ' _

Any process involving the use of~., -
, any of its preparations or oomp7-;;;.
except lead tetra-ethyl !_

Any process involving theuse ofme!'"
or its preparations or compound.;:

Workmen' s Compensation (A mendment)
Act, No. 31 of 1957

8

Amendment of
Schedule IV to
the principal
enactment.

~
I

" I
I

,,

I'

, ,



••

.. .....
' .... -~

F..
, .)

Workmen' 8 Compensation (Amendment) 9
Act, No. 31 oj 1957

(3) in column (3) of that Schedule, by the insertion
of the amount " 6,300 " at the end of that
column; and

(4) in column (4) of that Schedule, by the insertion,
at the end of that column, of the following: -

" 30 0 ".

..

r> \«. ,
~


